
NOTICES - 25/12/22 
 
1.Envelopes for the Advent campaign against Hunger & disease are kept at the 
exits. Kindly put in your contribution in the box in front of the altar. Payment should 
be made by cheque only. Kindly also fill in the details of your full name and address 
on the envelope, so that a receipt can be sent to you. 
 
2.Masses on 25th Dec - Christmas Day will be as follows 07:00 am Mass in Konkani, 
08:30 am and 10:00 am in English. Hindi mass at 04:00 pm. There will be NO 
Evening mass on Christmas Day. 
 
3.For the Small Christian Communities crib and star competition judging, judges will 
be coming around on Tuesday, 27th Dec. from 6.30 p.m. If you are making a 
collection at the crib, please do it for the Advent campaign for educating and skill 
training the under privileged, that is being conducted by the Centre for Social Action. 
 
4.On 27th December 2022, the 10 am Mass for the Sick and Home Bound has been 
cancelled due to lack of response.  
 
5.On 28th December 2022, Feast of the Holy Innocents, at 5.30 pm is the Sunday 
School Children’s Christmas Party. Blessing of infants and children will be done at 
the 7 pm Mass. 
 
6.Pre- baptismal Catechesis will be conducted online on the 29th December, 2022 at 
6 p.m. For further details, please send a WhatsApp message to Christabel Dsouza – 
9619292168.       
 
7.On 31st Dec there will be no evening Mass. From 10 pm – 11 pm we will have the 
Thanksgiving Holy Hour followed by the Solemn New Year Mass at 11 pm. We will 
follow the Sunday Schedule for Masses on 1st Jan 2023.  
 
8.The Parish has been recycling plastic since its commencement in July 2022. Till 
date we have recycled 105 kilos. Thank you and we look forward to continuous 
collaboration in caring for creation. The list of plastic and e- waste items are 
displayed on the Notice Board as well as forwarded among your respective 
communities. The bins for putting e-waste and plastic are marked and are kept near 
the church wall at the entrance. Parishioners are requested to drop their plastic 
waste and e waste in the respective bins that are marked for plastic and e waste. For 
further details kindly contact Jasmine on 91 09004087147 or the green cell team 
members. Details are on the Notice Board. 
 
9.Please note that Fr. Anil Rego will be out from 20th Dec to 21st Jan. In his 
absence, Fr. Savio Lobo will act as Parish Priest. 
 
10.LAST SUNDAY’S COLLECTION was Rs.80273/-. Thank you for your generosity. 
 


